
        HERCULES POLICE DEPARTMENT 
WATCH COMMANDER’S SHIFT REPORT 

 
DATE: September 4, 2024 TIME:    0700-0700          DAY: Wednesday 

 
THE FOLLOWING CASES ONLY REFLECT A PARTIAL LIST OF ACTUAL 

CASES TAKEN. CALLS FOR SERVICE NOT GENERATING WRITTEN 
REPORTS ARE NOT USUALLY LISTED. All THOSE ARRESTED ARE 

PRESUMED INNOCENT UNTIL PROVEN GUILTY  
 
Coroner’s Case: On September 4, 2024, at 2:13 PM officers responded to the Country Run 
Community pool for an unresponsive male. Officers located a 46 year old male laying on the 
ground not breathing and unresponsive. Life saving measures were performed by officers, 
Rodeo-Hercules Fire District, and AMR. The subject was determined to be deceased by 
paramedics on scene. Officers contacted next of kin, and the coroner responded and took 
possession of the body for further investigation. H24-00787 
 
Voluntary Missing Person: On September 4, 2024, at 3:13 PM officers responded to the 
1800 block of Lupine Road and contacted the Reporting Party (RP), 36 year old male. The 
RP wanted to report his mother, 66 year old female, missing. The missing person (MP) was 
last seen by her son on Saturday August 24, 2024, at approximately 6:30 PM. At this time, 
MP is not at risk and is voluntarily missing. MP was entered into the Missing and Unidentified 
Persons System. H24-00788 
 
Warrant Arrest: On September 4, 2024, at approximately 9:34 PM, an Officer conducted a 
traffic enforcement stop on a Nissan Sentra. The Officer contacted a passenger, 31 year old 
male of Antioch, in the vehicle. The subject was found to have two outstanding felony 
warrants issued by San Mateo County; both were citable. The subject was cited and released 
on scene. H24-00789 
 
Towed Vehicle: On September 5, 2024, at approximately 1:58 AM, an Officer checked on a 
suspicious vehicle at 1375 Willow Ave. The vehicle, a 2006 Buick, was observed parked for 
multiple days unoccupied. The Buick’s registration was expired in 2022 with no fees paid 
recently, however there was a 2024 registration tab affixed to the rear license plate. The 
vehicle was towed. H24-00790 
 


