
        HERCULES POLICE DEPARTMENT 
WATCH COMMANDER’S SHIFT REPORT 

 
DATE: August 1-4, 2024 TIME:    0700-0700          DAY: Thursday/Sunday 

 
THE FOLLOWING CASES ONLY REFLECT A PARTIAL LIST OF ACTUAL 

CASES TAKEN. CALLS FOR SERVICE NOT GENERATING WRITTEN 
REPORTS ARE NOT USUALLY LISTED. All THOSE ARRESTED ARE 

PRESUMED INNOCENT UNTIL PROVEN GUILTY  
 
Supplement to Case 24-00684: On August 2, 2024, at approximately 12:41 AM, an Officer 
was contacted by a homeowner in Diamond Court. The Homeowner was reporting that it 
appeared subjects broke back into his home approximately 1 hour ago and it was unknown if 
they were still inside. Pinole PD and San Pablo PD K9 responded, and a perimeter and entry 
team were established. The residence was cleared without any suspects being located. The 
residence was further ransacked and vandalized this time. The homeowner was not aware at 
the time that subjects had entered. The investigation is ongoing. H24-00684 
 
Towed Vehicle: On August 2, 2024, at 7:38 AM an officer located a vehicle parked in the 
area of John Muir Pkwy and San Pablo Avenue. The vehicle was a red Pontiac Montana Van 
and had expired registration for over six months and a day. The vehicle was towed. H24-
00688 
 
Battery: On August 3, 2024, at approximately 12:17 AM, Officers were dispatched to the 
3000 block of N Front Street for a report of a dispute between a repo driver and residents. 
Officers arrived and contacted the victim (V), 48 year old male of Oakland. V stated he is a 
repo driver and was attempting to repo an overdue rental, a 2021 Nissan Altima, from this 
location. V stated he has attempted to repo this Nissan multiple times. V began to attempt to 
load the vehicle onto the flatbed when 3 males exited a nearby residence and confronted 
him. One of the males shoved V and then punched him in the face. A younger male entered 
the Nissan and fled while the other two went back into the residence. V desired prosecution 
against the subject who punched him. Multiple attempts to contact the residents were made 
with no success. H24-00689 
 
Warrant Arrest: On August 3, 2024, at approximately 3:51 AM, Officers were dispatched to 
the 100 block of Paradise for a report of a male heard in the area kicking a door. Officers 
arrived and located the destroyed front door to a residence. A surround and call-out was 
conducted. A 30 year old male subject (SUB), of Hercules, exited the residence. SUB was 
detained and the residence was cleared without any other subjects inside. Contact was made 
with the homeowner, and she stated SUB does live there and is allowed to be there. The 
homeowner also did not want a report, or anything done for the damage. SUB was found to 
have two outstanding warrants for his arrest issued by our agency. SUB was transported to 
Martinez Detention Facility. Officers contacted property maintenance along with the 
homeowner being enroute. H24-00690 
 
Residential Burglary: On August 3, 2024, at 7:34 AM officers responded to Diamond Court 
for a burglary in progress. The victim (V) advised he could see the subjects on a live feed 
from his surveillance cameras within his home. Officers arrived and set a perimeter while V 
advised the suspects were still being seen within the home. With assistance from multiple 
agencies, including a K9 Unit from San Pablo, we made entry into the home and cleared the 



residence. The suspects fled prior to our arrival. Public Works arrived on scene to secure the 
residence. The investigation is ongoing. H24-00691 
 
Miscellaneous Information: On August 3, 2024, at approximately 8:30 PM, Officers were 
dispatched to a reported attempted robbery near 2525 Bayfront Blvd. The Reporting Party 
informed dispatch that someone attempted to rob his dog and provided a suspect description 
and direction of travel. When Officers arrived in the area, they located a subject later 
identified as a 32 year old male, of Hercules, who matched the description provided. A high-
risk pedestrian stop was conducted, and the subject was detained without incident. Upon 
taking both parties’ statements, it was determined that no crime had occurred. Case taken for 
documentation. H24-00692 
 


