
        HERCULES POLICE DEPARTMENT 
WATCH COMMANDER’S SHIFT REPORT 

 
DATE: December 14-17, 2023  TIME:    0700-0700          DAY: Thursday/Sunday 

 
THE FOLLOWING CASES ONLY REFLECT A PARTIAL LIST OF ACTUAL 

CASES TAKEN. CALLS FOR SERVICE NOT GENERATING WRITTEN 
REPORTS ARE NOT USUALLY LISTED. All THOSE ARRESTED ARE 

PRESUMED INNOCENT UNTIL PROVEN GUILTY  
 
Stolen Vehicle On December 14, 2023 at 11:35 PM an officer responded to the 100 block of 
Decatur Court for a report of a stolen Mercedes Benz EQS 580. The 31 year old male victim 
stated he left for vacation on December 10,2023 and when he returned today, he found his 
vehicle was missing H23-01210 
 
Stolen Vehicle: On December 15, 2023, at 1:23 pm, a resident called to report his vehicle 
had been stolen. The victim stated he parked his Red 2021 Chevrolet Camero with a black 
hood, in the area of John Muir Parkway at Tioga Loop around 2:00 am and when he returned 
to the location at approximately 12:30 pm his vehicle was gone. H23-01211 
 
Possession Of controlled substance and Ammo: On December 16,2023 at 3:24 AM an 
officer checked on a 1998 Lexus sedan, parked at the Grove Church in the 900 block of 
Willow Avenue. Officers contacted a 34 year old female, from Concord; and a 25 year old 
male, from Vallejo. The male is on searchable probation and was in possession of suspected 
methamphetamine, and ammunition. The male subject was arrested and transported to the 
Martinez Detention Facility. The female was released on scene. H23-01212 
 
Stolen Vehicle: On December 16, 2023 at 7:46 AM an officer was dispatched to the 600 
block of Forest Run for a stolen vehicle report. The 34 year old male victim advised his red 
2016 Hyundai Elantra had been stolen between 5:00 PM on December 15,2023 and 7:46 AM 
on December 16, 2023. The Hyundai was last recorded on FLOCK at 7:15 AM on December 
16, 2023 traveling North on San Pablo Avenue at Hercules Avenue. No suspect information 
was available. H23-01213 
 
Warrant Arrest: On December 16, 2023 at 12:03 an officer observed a 2003 black Mercedez 
SUV with no license plates. A traffic stop was conducted for vehicle code violations. The 42 
year old male passenger was determined to have an outstanding warrant for a probation 
violation. The subject was placed under arrest and transported to the Martinez Detention 
Facility for booking. H23-01214  
 
Battery, Criminal Threats, Vandalism: On December 17, 2023 at 9:53 AM officers were 
dispatched to a physical fight at the Safeway gas station. By the time officers arrived, the 
suspects had fled the scene. The 57 year old male victim (V-1) advised he had gotten into a 
verbal altercation with an unknown adult female (S-1.).  S-1 called an unidentified adult male 
(S-2) into the store to confront V-1. S-2 punched the V-1 in the face, with a closed fist, 
knocking V-1 to the ground. S-2 then stood over and threatened to continue to assault the V-
1. S-1, and S-2, walked back to their black 2013 Nissan Maxima.  A 55 year old female (V-2) 
attempted to take a picture of the license plate. S-2 struck the V-2 in the hand, with an open 
handed slap, to prevent her from taking the picture. The phone fell to the ground and S-2 
picked it up threw the phone across the parking lot, damaging the phone. S-2 threatened V-2 
and V-1 by stating he would return to find them with his “boys. H23-1215 


