
        HERCULES POLICE DEPARTMENT 
WATCH COMMANDER’S SHIFT REPORT 

 
DATE: Sept. 28 Oct. 1, 2023  TIME:    0700-0700          DAY: Thursday-Sunday 

 
THE FOLLOWING CASES ONLY REFLECT A PARTIAL LIST OF ACTUAL 

CASES TAKEN. CALLS FOR SERVICE NOT GENERATING WRITTEN 
REPORTS ARE NOT USUALLY LISTED. All THOSE ARRESTED ARE 

PRESUMED INNOCENT UNTIL PROVEN GUILTY  
 
Guns Turned in for Destruction: On September 28, 2023, at 1:46 pm, officers were 
dispatched, to a Hercules residence, for a citizen who was cleaning out her father’s house 
and located two shotguns she wished to turn in for destruction. The weapons were booked 
into property for destruction.  H23-00994 
 
Driver’s License Suspension for Driving Under the Influence: On September 28, 2023, at 
4:43 pm, an officer conducted a traffic stop, for a vehicle code violation, on a 2010 Mercedes. 
The 63 year old male driver, of Hercules, was found to have a suspended license for Driving 
Under the Influence. The subject was cited and released. H23-00995 
 
Warrant Arrest: On September 28, 2023, at 5:14 pm, an officer checked on a Motorhome, in 
the parking lot of Safeway, with expired registration. The 68 year old female driver, of Walnut 
Creek, was found to have an outstanding No Bail warrant. The subject was arrested and 
transported to the Martinez Detention Facility. H23-00996 
 
Vandalism: On September 28, 2023, at 12:55am, HPD Officers were dispatched to the 1000 
block of Regatta Pt for a reported broken window on a Dodge Challenger. The reporting party 
advised nothing was taken from the Dodge and estimated it would cost $300 to repair the 
window. H23-00997 
 
Follow up (H23-00982) / Stolen Vehicle Recovery: On September 29, 2023, at 2:59am 
Vallejo PD notified HPD they located our suspect vehicle (2014 Honda Accord) for case H23-
00982 (Strong Arm Robbery, which occurred on September 25, 2023). Vallejo PD advised 
the vehicle was unoccupied with different plates affixed to the front and rear. Both plates 
were reported lost/stolen to Vallejo PD on September 29, 2023. A Records check of the VIN 
showed the Honda was reported stolen to Sacramento PD on September 23, 2023. An 
Officer responded to Vallejo and a rotational Tow Company responded to tow the Honda for 
evidence. H23-00982/H23-00998 
 
Warrant Arrest: On September 29, 2023, at 8:57 PM an Officer conducted a traffic stop at in 
the 800 block of Willow Ave, on a 2010 Chevrolet Malibu, for a vehicle code violation. The 29 
year old female driver, of Rodeo, was found to have a cite-able warrant out of LA County. 
The subject was arrested, cited, and released on her signed promise to appear. H23-00999 
 
Mental Health Evaluation: On September 29, 2023, at 9:32 PM HPD Officers were 
dispatched to the 300 block of Sorrento for a welfare check. Reporting Party stated her 51 
year old mother texted her that she wanted to hurt herself. HPD Officers contacted mother at 
her residence and determined she was a danger to herself. The subject was transported, by 
ambulance, to the County Regional Medical Center for evaluation. H23-01000 
 



Possession of a Controlled Substance: On September 30, 2023, at 01:01 AM a HPD 
Officer conducted a pedestrian stop in the 800 block of Willow Ave on a 29 year old male, of 
Clearlake. A probable cause search was conducted, and a baggie of suspected fentanyl was 
located in the subject’s pocket. The subject was arrested, cited, and released H23-01001 
 
Unattended Death: On September 30, 2023, at 1:23 pm, officers were dispatched to the 
1000 block of Valley Run for a possible death. The reporting party called and stated he 
located his father deceased, and there was a Do Not Resuscitate order on file. Officer arrived 
on scene and located a 78 year old male deceased in the residence. The subject was 
released to the family by the coroner. H23-01002 
 
Mental Health Evaluation: On September 30, 2023, at 9:32 PM HPD Officers were 
dispatched to Lucky for an unknown issue regarding a male wearing a black coat in front of 
the store. Officers contacted a 53 year old male, of Richmond, The subject stated he stated 
he called HPD on himself. After speaking with the subject, he was determined to be a danger 
to himself or others. The subject was transported, by ambulance, to the County Regional 
Medical Cener for evaluation. H23-01003 
 
Driving Under the Influence: On October 1, 2023, at 1:58 AM an Officer conducted a traffic 
stop on a Toyota Corolla, for a traffic violation, on San Pablo Ave at Victoria Crescent. The 24 
year old male driver displayed objective symptoms of intoxication. He was given the Standard 
Field Sobriety Test. The Preliminary Alcohol Screening device indicated the subject was over 
the presumptive limit for the purposes of driving. The subject was arrested and later cited and 
released to fa responsible party. H23-01004 
 
Domestic Violence: On October 1, 2023, at 10:18 PM HPD Officers were dispatched to the 
100 block of Coventry for a domestic dispute that occurred earlier in the night.  The 43 year 
old female victim stated she got into an argument with her 49 year old husband. During the 
argument the husband pushed his wife, causing her to fall onto a baby gate. The victim 
sustained minor scrapes to her arm due to the fall. After the altercation husband left the 
residence prior to PD arrival. The victim declined prosecution and an Emergency Protective 
Order. The male subject was contacted over the phone who stated he was currently in a 
hotel. A case was taken for domestic violence and forwarded to the DA’s Office. H23-01005 
 
 


