
        HERCULES POLICE DEPARTMENT 
WATCH COMMANDER’S SHIFT REPORT 

 
DATE: July 18, 2023  TIME:    0700-0700          DAY: Tuesday 

 
THE FOLLOWING CASES ONLY REFLECT A PARTIAL LIST OF ACTUAL 

CASES TAKEN. CALLS FOR SERVICE NOT GENERATING WRITTEN 
REPORTS ARE NOT USUALLY LISTED. All THOSE ARRESTED ARE 

PRESUMED INNOCENT UNTIL PROVEN GUILTY  
 
Warrant Arrest: On July 18, 2023, at approximately 11:48 AM, a Riverside County Detective 
notified Hercules Officers about a wanted suspect, who was believed to be in Hercules. The 
49 year old male suspect had a One Million dollar warrant, out of Riverside County, for 
Burglary.  The suspect was associated with a white GMC Sierra with Arizona license plates. 
An Officer located the GMC traveling on Sycamore Ave at Refugio Valley Rd. The Officer 
monitored the vehicle until sufficient units arrived. A stop was conducted on the Pinole Valley 
Rd Off-Ramp of westbound I-80. The male driver was detained while his identity and the 
warrant were confirmed The subject was arrested on the outstanding warrant. The Riverside 
County Detective was contacted. The subject was transported to the Martinez Detention 
Facility without incident. Case 23-00726 
 
Mental Health Evaluation: On July 18, 2023, at approximately 5:22 PM, Officers were 
dispatched to Bayfront Blvd at Railroad Ave regarding a female who was on the train tracks 
near this location. Officers arrived and observed the 52 year old female, of El Sobrante, 
laying on the train tracks with a train coming. The subject was safely removed from the tracks 
and detained. The subject was determined to be a danger to herself. AMR responded and 
transported the subject to the County Regional Medical Center for evaluation. Case 23-00728 
 
Traffic Collision: On July 18, 2023, at approximately 6:32 PM, Officers were dispatched to a 
vehicle collision at the Hercules Swim Center. The reporting party advised a vehicle had 
driven through a fence on the property. An Officer determined a 78 year old male, of 
Hercules, was being taught how to drive by his 49 year old daughter. The male stepped on 
the gas pedal, instead of the brake pedal, and drove through the swim center’s fence causing 
moderate damage. The driver and passenger declined medical attention. City Employees 
were on scene and Public works was notified as well. Case 23-00729 
 
 


