
        HERCULES POLICE DEPARTMENT 
WATCH COMMANDER’S SHIFT REPORT 

 
DATE: June 29-July 2,, 2023  TIME:    0700-0700       DAY: Thurs/Sunday 

 
THE FOLLOWING CASES ONLY REFLECT A PARTIAL LIST OF ACTUAL 

CASES TAKEN. CALLS FOR SERVICE NOT GENERATING WRITTEN 
REPORTS ARE NOT USUALLY LISTED. All THOSE ARRESTED ARE 

PRESUMED INNOCENT UNTIL PROVEN GUILTY  
 
Driving on a Suspended Driver’s License with Prior DUI’s: On June 29, 2023 at  2:42 PM 
and officer observed a black Honda Accord. The officer stopped the vehicle for various 
vehicle code violations. The 33 year old male driver was found to be driving on a suspended 
driver’s license for a prior Driving Under Influence. The subject was placed under arrest, cited 
and released. H23-00664 
 
Mental Health Evaluation Hold: On June 29, 2023 at 4:18 PM, officers were dispatched to a 
report of a woman, who was seated inside her car, possibly cutting herself with a knife. 
Officers observed a 21 year old female seated in her vehicle, armed with a knife. The subject 
willingly exited the vehicle, unarmed. No injuries were observed on the subject’s body. The 
subject was determined to be a danger to herself or others. The subject indicated she was 
wanted to hurt herself. The subject was transported to the County Regional Medical Center, 
by AMR for evaluation. H23-00665 
 
Prisoner Transport: On June 29, 2023 at 7:04 PM an officer picked up, and transported, a 
40 year old male, from Stanislaus County jail. The subject was transported to the Martinez 
Detention Facility for an outstanding Hercules warrant. H23-00666 
 
Found Property: On June 30, 2023 at 9 :31 AM an officer took a case for some found cash 
which had been located by an officer. H23-00667 
 
Mental Health Evaluation Hold/ At Risk Missing Person Locate: On June 30, 2023 at 
10:08 AM, an officer observed a 44 year old female walking through the intersection of 
Sycamore Avenue at Willow Avenue.  The subject was obstructing mutliple lanes of traffic. 
Several cars had to brake to avoid hitting the subject. The subject was contacted by officers 
and was non compliant. She attempted to leave the area several times. The subject 
attempted to run back into active lanes of traffic, at which time she was detained by officers. 
The subject provided a false name as officers attempted to identify her. The subject had 
identification on her person and was identified as a missing at risk person. The subject was 
determined to be a danger to herself, and others, and was transported to the County 
Regional Medical Center for evaluation, by AMR.  H23-00668 
 
Attempted Occupied Stolen Vehicle Recovery/ Reckless Evasion/ Hit and Run: On July 
1, 2023 at 9:15 AM an officer located a stolen red Hyundai Sonata, occupied by one, parked 
along the curb on Clark at Tsushima. The vehicle was blocked to the front by an unoccupied 
Toyota Tundra. There was an unoccupied sedan, parked directly to the rear of the Hyundai, 
blocking it’s path of flight to the rear. The officer observed an unknown suspect seated in the 
driver seat of the stolen Hyundai. The officer blocked the Hyundai against the curb, with his 
patrol car, cutting off a potential path of evasion to Clark street. The suspect began to reach 
towards the floorboard, of the passenger side, disregarding multiple officer commands to stop 
reaching. The suspect then started the Hyundai and abruptly rammed the unoccupied Toyota 



parked in front of it. The force of the ram allowed the suspect room to maneuver. The suspect 
drove over the curb and into Bayside Park. The suspect drove over a tree, through Bayside 
Park, on the grass, and back onto Tsushima street. The Hyundai continued towards San 
Pablo avenue. Officers attempted to deploy stop sticks but were unsuccessful due to the 
suspect’s dangerous high rate of speed. The vehicle was last seen fleeing into Pinole. At no 
point in time did officers engage in a pursuit of the vehicle. An officer contacted the owner of 
the Toyota and advised him what had occurred. A canvass of the area determined no other 
vehicles or property was damaged.  H23-00669 
 
Possession of. Controlled Substance: On July 1, 2023 at approximately 6:30pm, an officer 
checked on a white Ford F150 at Rite Aid. The 32 year old female driver, of Forbestown, 
admitted there was drug paraphernalia inside her purse. A search of the F150 was conducted 
which resulted in suspected methamphetamine being seized. The subject was arrested, cited 
and released. H23-00670  
 
Vandalism: On July 1, 2023 at 7:50pm, an officer was dispatched to the 200 block of Drake 
for a vandalism. The Hercules resident stated at approximately 2:30pm she was shopping at 
the Safeway, in Hercules, when an unknown subject keyed her 2022 Tesla. The victim 
received video footage, from her Tesla, showing an unknown male causing damage to the 
driver’s side of the Tesla. H23-00671 
 
Prisoner Transport: On July 1, 2023 at 7:23pm, an officer transported a 40 year old male 
from Santa Rita Jail to Martinez Detention Facility, for a Hercules Warrant.. H23-00672 
 
Outside Assist: On July 2, 2023 at approximately 00:06am, dispatch advised Stockton CHP 
was in pursuit of a red Lexus with a black hood, no plates, used in sideshow activity where 
rounds were fired from a Rifle. The Lexus was travelling westbound in the eastbound lanes of 
Highway 4 passing McEwen Road. The Lexus continued wrong way into Hercules. After 
several attempts of evading CHP by continuing wrong way on Hwy 4, the Lexus received a 
successful PIT maneuver, conducted by CHP, on the westbound I80 on ramp from John Muir 
Pkwy. The adult male driver of Oakley, immediately fled from the vehicle but was quickly 
detained by HPD on eastbound Hwy 4 under I80 and turned over to CHP. H23-00673 
 
Elder Abuse: On July 2, 2023, at approximately 11:26 AM, Officers were dispatched to the 
500 block of Dutch Elm Dr for a report of a male dragging his mother out of a vehicle and 
pushing her back into their house. Officers contacted a 52 year old male, of Hercules. The 
male stated he and his 81 year old mother got into a dispute about her refusing care at a 
hospital earlier in the day. She refused to exit the car, so the subject assisted her out of the 
vehicle and pushed her inside. Officers then contacted the mother, who stated the same. A 
case was taken for documentation and Adult Protective Services was notified. Case 23-
00674 
 
Warrant Arrest X2/ Possession of a Controlled Substance: On July 2, 2023, at 
approximately 1:10 PM, an Officer conducted a pedestrian stop on a 42 year old female, of 
Oakland. The subject was found to have two outstanding warrants one from San Luis Obispo 
County Sheriff’s Office and one from Lake County Sheriff’s Office. Located on the subject’s 
person was suspected Methamphetamine and drug paraphernalia. The subject was arrested, 
cited on the warrants and on-view charges, and released. Case 23-00675 
 
Unlawfully Causing a Fire: On July 2, 2023, at approximately 2:23 PM, Officers were 
dispatched to the area of Bayfront Blvd at John Muir Parkway on the bay trail for a report of a 
small fire caused by fireworks. The reporting party stated they observed two males lighting off 
fireworks on the near bay trail when a small brush fire started from the fireworks. The two 



males were then seen going into the Exchange apartment’s once the fire started. Officers 
arrived and the fire quickly spread causing a full grass fire that engulfed the vacant lot near 
The Grand, spreading to the rear of Bio Rad. Fire personnel responded and gained control of 
the fire after approximately two hours.. Case 23-00678 

 
 
Theft/Evading/Attempted Carjacking: On July 02, 2023, at approximately 5:15 PM, Officers 
were dispatched to Rite Aid for an in progress theft. The loss was three cases of beer While 
Officers were in-route, the reporting party stated that the suspects got into a white sedan and 
left the area. An Officer observed a white Chrysler 200 leaving the area on Sycamore Ave 
driving towards Turquoise Dr. The Officer U-turned believing this could possibly be the 
involved vehicle. The Chrysler then U-turned on Sycamore Ave at Refugio Valley Rd and 
continued westbound on Sycamore Ave. The Officer finally caught up with the Chrysler 200 
as it entered onto eastbound Highway 4 from Willow Ave. The Officer was able to get the 
license plate of the Chrysler and then tried to stop the Chrysler at Claeys Ranch, the Willow 
Ave off-ramp of eastbound Highway 4. The Officer activated their lights, and the Chrysler 
began to yield onto the off-ramp. The Chrysler then diverted back onto eastbound Highway 4, 
then drove wrong way down the on-ramp of Willow Ave at eastbound Highway 4. The Officer 
immediately shut his lights off and did not purse the Chrysler. The Chrysler drove through the 
grass in the on/off ramp area of Highway 4 and drove wrong way on the Willow Ave off ramp, 
westbound, entering eastbound Highway 4 then U-turning and driving eastbound in the 
eastbound Highway 4 lanes. The Officer continued on eastbound highway and monitored the 
Chrysler as it continued on eastbound Highway 4 (driving at the posted speed limit, with no 
lights or siren). Far ahead the Officer observed the Chrysler pass the Golf Course, and enter 
onto Christie Rd. The Officer knew that Christie Rd is a dead end turn around with ranches 
and hiking trails. Based on the totality of the circumstances and the obvious disregard for 
public safety shown by the driver of the Chrysler, Officers set up for a spike strip for the 
Chrysler return. A few minutes later, the Chrysler returned, and a successful spike strip 
contact occurred. The Chrysler became disabled as it entered onto eastbound Highway 4. 
The 23 year old male driver, of Sacramento; and the 30 year old female passenger of 
Sacramento, both fled on foot from the Chrysler. The female ran down the side of Highway 4. 
The male ran up to a white Toyota Camry, as it was stopped for the Chrysler blocking the 
lanes of traffic. The male suspect utilized a large pocketknife, with the blade open, and 
brandished the Knife at the driver. The suspect then used the back of the knife and punched 
out the driver’s side window of the Camry. The suspect reached inside the Camry in an 
attempt to carjack the driver of their Camry. The 20 year old female driver, fearing for her life, 
accelerated quickly, the suspect hung on to the victim’s vehicle and was dragged 
approximately 50 feet when he finally let go of the Camry. The suspect got up and ran 
towards a CHP officer’s vehicle. The male suspect refused commands to stop and ultimately 
a Hercules Officer deployed his Taser. The male suspect continued his resistance but was 
ultimately detained by Officers. A Hercules Officer caught up with the female suspect, as she 
slowly ran down Highway 4. The female suspect physically resisted the Officer but was 



ultimately detained by the single Officers. Both subjects were treated on scene and 
transported to John Muir Hospital. The female initially lied about her name. A fingerprint 
scanner revealed her true name, and she was found to have 3 outstanding warrants from 
various counties. An Officer followed the two suspects, as they were transported by 
Ambulance, to John Muir Hospital.  When the suspects were medically cleared the officer 
transported them to the Martinez Detention Facility for booking. Case 23-00679 
 
Warrant Arrest: On July 2, 2023, at 11:48 pm, an officer conducted a traffic stop on a black 
Toyota sedan at the intersection of Lupine and Heather. A Records check on the occupants 
revealed the 26 year old female passenger, of Fairfield, had an outstanding warrant for her 
arrest out of San Jose PD. The subject was arrested, cited,.and released.  H23-680.  
 
 


